
begotten Son, that whosoever believeth in him 
should not perish, but have everlasting life.” 
John 3:16. “...choose you this day whom ye will 
serve...” Joshua 24:15. By your choice, you and 
you alone determine your eternal destiny. Why 
not choose Christ and life eternal.
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JUDGMENT DAY IS COMING

“It is appointed unto men once to die, but 
after this the JUDGMENT...” Hebrews 9:27. 
John saw the GREAT WHITE THRONE 
JUDGMENT: “And I (John) saw a great white 
throne, and him that sat on it, from whose face 
the earth and heaven fled away; ‒ and I saw the 
dead small and great, stand before God; ‒ and 
they were judged; ‒ and whosoever was not 
found written in the book of life was cast into 
the lake of fire.” Revelation 20:11-15

It is here plainly stated that, at this GREAT 
WHITE THRONE JUDGMENT, the one vital 
qualification for ETERNAL LIFE is to have 
one’s name recorded in the LAMB’S BOOK 
OF LIFE. This recording of the name occurs 
the moment one is saved.

Every person who hears the gospel is 
confronted with the following great question: 
Where and When will you meet God? Will you 
meet Him at the GREAT WHITE THRONE
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JUDGMENT, after death and when it is too 
late for salvation? Or will you meet Him at 
CALVARY’S CROSS, where your sins have 
been judged and will be blotted out when 
you receive Jesus Christ as savior. Romans 
10:9-10 tells us how we can be saved. “That 
if thou shalt confess with thy mouth the Lord 
Jesus, and shalt believe in thine heart that God 
hath raised him from the dead, thou shalt be 
saved. For with the heart man believeth unto 
righteousness; and with the mouth confession 
is made unto salvation.”

The BIBLE declares: “...behold, now is the 
accepted time; behold, now is the day of salva-
tion.” II Corinthians 6:2. You may ignore God 
and neglect your salvation, ‒ but...“what shall 
it profit a man, if he shall gain the whole world, 
and lose his own soul?” Mark 8:36.

“It is a fearful thing to fall into the hands of 
the living God.” Hebrews 10:31. Or you may 
wisely come to Jesus Christ and be saved. “For 
God so loved the world, that he gave his only
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